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Induction Programme Report -2023-24 

 According to the decision of the meeting held on Thursday 
03/08/2023 in Public Administration Department on Saturday 
05/08/2023 . An Induction Program was conducted under the 
department for the first year Public Administration students. 
Inaugural program concluded at ICT Hall No.14 at exactly 12:00 
PM. In the Academic year 2023 24, a convocation program was 
held for the students admitted for BA first year. Dr. B. R. 
KatturwarDegloor College, Degloor Was the chief guest for this 
commencement program.  The keynote speaker is Head of 
Department of Public Administration, Degloor College, 



 
 
 
 
 

Degloor. He is the former Chairman of the Board of Public 
Administration Studies as well as a member of the Board of 
Public Administration Studies at S.R.T.M.U. Nanded. 
  The program started with a welcome ceremony. First of 
all, the Chief Guest was welcomed by the Vice Principal of the 
College Prof. Kavita Sonkamble President of the program Prof. 
Poetry was done by Sonkamble madam. The president of the 
program Prof. KavitaSonkamble Madam was welcomed by Dr. 
Head of Public Administration Department. Mira Phad did it by 
giving a bouquet.  
  Department Head of Public Administration Department 
Dr.MeeraPhad gave information to the students about the 
facilities and library available in the college while making the 
introduction. Students were informed about NSS, NCC, ICC, 
Girls Hostel, Women Reform and Security Committee Student 
Aid Forum and also various forces in public administration such 
as Basic Principles of Public Administration, Organization 
District & Maharashtra state Administration personnel & 
Financial Administration , Rural and Urban local Government, 
Indian Constitution, Indian Administration, Indian & Western 
Administrative Thinkers etc. students will be able to acquire the 
relevant knowledge. She  also tell on what are POs & Cos 
related to the course. Commented by Meera Phad. 
  The Chief Guest while guiding the students asserted that 
"Administration is related to the life of a person from before 
birth to after death" Dr.Ktturwar guided the students about the 
very important aspects of how an administrator should be, what 
qualities he should have, who should be called an ideal 
administrator by telling many touching stories. At the same time, 
public administration is a knowledge-giving subject that is 
necessary for various competitive exams. Not only this, but 
through this subject, the students acquire the skills required to 



 
 
 
 
 

perform the responsibilities that have to be performed in a good 
manner while working as an actual officer. Students understand 
all the theories right from planning to execution of a task. 
  The presiding officer of the ceremony was Dr. Prof. Kavita 
Sonkamble Vice Principal of the College. Kavita Sonkamble 
gave the presidential conclusion. Speaking on the occasion, she 
said that public administration and political science are two sides 
of the same coin and they work hand in hand. 
  Department Head of Public Administration Department 
Dr.Meera Phad moderated the program proposed the program 
and introduced the guests while Lt. Dr. R. P. Gawande expressed 
his thanks at the end of the program and the program was 
concluded. A large number of public administration students of 
the college attended the commencement program. 



 
 
 
 
 

 



 
 
 
 
 

 



 
 
 
 
 

 

 

 

 

 



 
 
 
 
 

 

 



 
 
 
 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 
 
 
 
 

 

 



 
 
 
 
 

 


